

BID #17G81 - PAINT & PAINT SUPPLIES

<u>SUPPLIES</u>	<u>Modern Paint Group</u>	<u>Seaford Paint Place</u>	<u>Sherwin Williams</u>	<u>Elmont Paint</u>
1. All purpose 100% acrylic primer mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$23.39 gal \$111.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$10.47 gal \$44.90 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$9.85 gal \$40.00 5 gal	PPG-17-921 \$17.49 gal \$86.99 5 gal
2. Soft gloss fortified acrylic house paint mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$41.49 gal \$205.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$17.69 gal \$80.38 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$17.75 gal \$87.50 5 gal	PPG 78-811XI \$18.99 gal \$92.45 5 gal
3. Low lustre fortified acrylic house paint mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$41.49 gal \$205.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$17.55 gal \$80.00 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$17.40 gal \$85.50 5 gal	PPG 76-110XI \$18.99 gal \$92.45 5 gal
4. Flat fortified acrylic house paint mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$33.79 gal \$167.19 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$14.60 gal \$68.95 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$14.70 gal \$73.50 5 gal	PPG 72-110XI \$17.99 gal \$87.45 5 gal
5. Flat finish wall satin mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$35.59 gal \$169.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$12.41 gal \$55.75 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$11.90 gal \$59.50 5 gal	PPG 6-70 \$11.99 gal \$59.00 5 gal
6. Interior latex eggshell aquavelvet mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$38.39 gal \$190.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$14.85 gal \$70.62 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$13.45 gal \$67.25 5 gal	PPG 4-111 \$14.50 gal \$69.99 5 gal
7. Interior semi-gloss mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$39.19 gal \$194.19 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$15.70 gal \$73.37 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$15.35 gal \$76.75 5 gal	PPG 6-500 \$14.75 gal \$71.99 5 gal

BID #17G81 - PAINT & PAINT SUPPLIES

	<u>Modern Paint Group</u>	<u>Seaford Paint Place</u>	<u>Sherwin Williams</u>	<u>Elmont Paint</u>
8. Interior latex primer mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$15.99 gal \$69.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$10.47 gal \$44.90 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$9.85 gal \$48.75 5 gal	PPG 12-900XI \$7.99 gal \$39.45 5 gal
9. Interior latex eggshell enamel mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$21.89 gal \$96.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$14.89 gal \$66.00 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$13.40 gal \$66.75 5 gal	PPG 47-310 \$11.99 gal \$59.95 5 gal
10. Latex semi-gloss enamel mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$23.39 gal \$99.39 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$15.75 gal \$70.25 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$15.90 gal \$71.00 5 gal	PPG 47-510 \$12.99 gal \$64.95 5 gal
11. Latex flat mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$17.19 gal \$69.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$12.45 gal \$53.80 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$10.75 gal \$49.95 5 gal	PPG 47-110 \$7.79 gal \$38.95 5 gal
12. Latex semi-gloss enamel mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$23.09 gal \$99.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$15.75 gal \$70.25 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$15.90 gal \$71.25 5 gal	PPG 12-510 \$14.89 gal \$73.45 5 gal
13. Latex primer/undercoater mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$15.00 gal \$64.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$10.47 gal \$44.90 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$9.75 gal \$46.00 5 gal	PPG 6-2 \$9.25 gal \$44.95 5 gal
14. Latex eggshell enamel mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$22.09 gal \$98.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$14.89 gal \$66.00 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$14.40 gal \$66.50 5 gal	PPG 12-310XI \$13.25 gal \$64.95 5 gal

BID #17G81 - PAINT & PAINT SUPPLIES

	<u>Modern Paint Group</u>	<u>Seaford Paint Place</u>	<u>Sherwin Williams</u>	<u>Elmont Paint</u>
15. Latex flat mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$18.89 gal \$84.89 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$12.45 gal \$53.80 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$10.00 gal \$50.00 5 gal	PPG 47-12-110XI \$9.25 gal \$44.95 5 gal
16. Polyamide Epoxy Gloss Coating mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$104.99 gal no bid 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$45.00 gal \$204.00 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$43.00 gal \$195.00 5 gal	PPG 95-1 \$105.00 gal \$525.00 5 gal
17. D.M.T. Alkryd Low Lustre Enamel mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$38.99 gal n/a 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$24.00 gal \$108.00 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$23.00 gal \$100.00 5 gal	Ben Moore P23-Line \$36.99 gal \$184.95 5 gal
18. Urethane Alkryd Gloss Enamel mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$26.99 gal \$124.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$19.75 gal \$91.00 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$18.95 gal \$88.75 5 gal	PPG 7-Line \$26.99 gal \$134.95 5 gal
19. Latex Floor & Patio Enamel mfg proposed	Benjamin Moore \$39.59 gal n/a 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$23.10 gal \$111.00 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$22.50 gal \$105.95 5 gal	PPG 3-510 \$24.75 gal \$123.75 5 gal
20. Penetrating Interior Wood Stain mfg proposed	no bid gal 5 gal	Minwax \$8.75 *quart no bid	Sherwin Williams \$8.99 qt no bid 5 gal	Minwax \$33.99 gal \$169.95 5 gal
21. Rubber Based Swimming Pool Paint mfg proposed	RP2710 \$59.99 gal \$297.99 5 gal	Benjamin Moore \$44.00 gal \$210.00 5 gal	Sherwin Williams \$51.56 gal \$258.33 5 gal	Insl-x \$54.00 gal \$270.00 5 gal

BID #17G81 - PAINT & PAINT SUPPLIES

	<u>Modern Paint Group</u>	<u>Seaford Paint Place</u>	<u>Sherwin Williams</u>	<u>Elmont Paint</u>
<u>SUPPLIES</u>				
1. Paint Thinners, Removers & Solvents				
	mfg proposed	Klean Strip/Rock Miracle	Pacoq	Sherwin Williams
Solvent & Cleaner	\$4.50 qt	\$3.99 qt	\$3.90	no bid qt
	\$9.75 gal	\$7.75 gal	\$7.70 gal	gal
Laquer thinner	\$4.50 qt	\$4.25 qt	\$4.20 qt	no bid qt
	\$13.00 gal	\$11.45 gal	\$11.40 gal	gal
Paint remover	\$11.75 qt	no bid qt	n/a qt	no bid qt
	\$30.00 gal	\$18.99 gal	\$18.90 gal	gal
2. Varnish				
	mfg proposed	Minwax	Pacoq	Sherwin Williams
	\$13.99 qt	\$10.50 qt	\$8.75 qt	no bid qt
	\$49.99 gal	\$24.99 gal	\$19.97 gal	gal
3. Shellac				
	mfg proposed	Zinzer Bullseye	Zinsser	Sherwin Williams
#3 Cut	\$15.00 qt	\$8.99 qt	\$8.90 qt	no bid qt
	\$46.00 gal	\$28.99 gal	\$28.85 gal	gal
#4 Cut	no bid qt	\$9.99 qt	\$9.90 qt	no bid qt
	no bid gal	\$29.99 gal	\$29.85 gal	gal
#5 Cut	no bid qt	\$10.99 qt	\$10.90 qt	no bid qt
	no bid gal	\$31.99 gal	\$31.85 gal	gal
4. Water sealant (silicone)				
	mfg proposed	Thompsons	Thompsons	
	\$19.99 gal	no bid gal	\$13.99 gal	no bid gal

BID #17G81 - PAINT & PAINT SUPPLIES

		<u>Modern Paint Group</u>		<u>Seaford Paint Place</u>		<u>Sherwin Williams</u>		<u>Elmont Paint</u>	
5. Brushes (Liebco)	mfg proposed price list dated Discount	Liebco 10/17/2017 see #1		Linzer 10/1/2011 20%		Sherwin Williams 2017 30%		no bid	
Throw away brushes:	1"	\$0.69	ea	\$0.25	ea	\$0.47	ea	\$0.26	ea
	2"	\$0.89	ea	\$0.35	ea	\$0.71	ea	\$0.43	ea
	3"	\$1.50	ea	\$0.60	ea	\$0.85	ea	\$0.65	ea
	4"	\$1.95	ea	\$1.70	ea	\$1.70	ea	\$1.20	ea

ROLLERS & ROLLER SLEEVES AND TRAYS

	Mfg Propsed	Wooster		Linzer		Sherwin Williams		Premier	
1. Wood handle Rollers, Wooster 9"		\$5.25	ea	\$3.99	ea	\$3.95	ea	\$4.29	ea
2. Plastic handle rollers	7"	\$5.25	ea	\$1.25	ea	\$1.45	ea	no bid	ea
	9"	\$5.50	ea	\$1.60	ea	\$1.70	ea		ea
3. Roller trays - aluminum	10"x15"	no bid	ea	\$1.79	ea	\$1.80	ea	no bid	ea
	11"x16"	\$3.25	ea	\$2.09	ea	\$2.10	ea	no bid	ea
plastic Liners	10"x 15"	no bid	ea	\$0.79	ea	\$0.85	ea	no bid	ea
	11"x16"	\$0.80	ea	\$1.19	ea	\$1.25	ea	no bid	ea
4. Extension handles, Sherlock									
Fiberglass	2' - 4'	\$19.25		\$10.90	ea	\$10.95	ea	\$10.99	ea
	6' - 12'	\$30.50		\$17.90	ea	\$17.95	ea	\$20.59	ea
Wood	2' - 4'	\$4.00		\$11.29	ea	\$11.45	ea	no bid	ea
	6' - 12'	\$4.00		\$13.79	ea	\$14.90	ea	no bid	ea

MASKING TAPE

1. 3/4" x 60 yards	\$1.75	roll	\$1.29	roll	\$1.10	roll	no bid	roll
2. 1" x 60 yards	\$2.50	roll	\$1.19	roll	\$1.09	roll	no bid	roll
3. 2" x 60 yards	\$6.25	roll	\$1.99	roll	\$2.00	roll	no bid	roll

BID #17G81 - PAINT & PAINT SUPPLIES

	<u>Modern Paint Group</u>	<u>Seaford Paint Place</u>	<u>Sherwin Williams</u>	<u>Elmont Paint</u>
<u>VINYL TAPE</u>				
1. 3/4" X 60 yards	\$1.10 roll	\$2.99 roll	\$2.95 roll	no bid roll
2. 1" x 60 yards	\$2.50 roll	\$3.99 roll	\$3.95 roll	no bid roll
3. 2" x 60 yards	\$3.99 roll	no bid roll	\$4.19 roll	no bid roll
<u>EASY MASK PAINTERS TAPE</u>				
1. 2"	\$5.50 roll	\$3.99 roll	\$3.95 roll	no bid roll
2. 3"	\$7.75 roll	\$4.49 roll	\$4.40 roll	no bid roll
3. 6"	no bid roll	\$7.99 roll	\$7.95 roll	no bid roll
<u>JOINT COMPOUND</u>				
	\$7.50 gal	\$5.99 gal	\$4.29 gal	no bid gal
	\$18.50 5 gal	\$14.99 5 gal	\$13.50 5 gal	no bid 5 gal
<u>SPACKLE PASTE</u>				
	\$7.50 gal	\$12.89 gal	\$11.27 gal	no bid gal
<u>SPACKLING TAPE</u>				
1. Perforated 150'	\$2.25 ea	\$2.69 ea	\$2.75 ea	no bid ea
2. Solid 150'	\$2.50 ea	\$1.89 ea	\$1.49 ea	no bid ea
3. Fiber glass 300'	\$5.25 ea	\$6.79 ea	\$4.77 ea	\$4.75 ea
<u>SPACKLING KNIVES</u>				
1. 3"	\$7.50 ea	\$1.89 ea	\$1.95 ea	no bid ea
2. 6"	\$9.00 ea	\$2.69 ea	\$2.75 ea	no bid ea
3. 8"	\$11.00 ea	\$6.79 ea	\$6.95 ea	no bid ea
<u>DROP CLOTHS</u>				
1. Disposable				
a. 9'x12',plastic 1 mil	\$1.75 ea	\$1.19 ea	\$1.25 ea	no bid ea
b. 9'x12',plastic 4 mil	\$4.75 ea	\$2.39 ea	\$2.45 ea	no bid ea
c. 9'x12',100% cotton 12 oz	\$28.50 ea	\$14.79 ea	\$14.90 ea	no bid ea

BID #14G77 - PAINT & PAINT SUPPLIES

	<u>Modern Paint Group</u>	<u>Seaford Paint Place</u>	<u>Sherwin Williams</u>	<u>Elmont Paint</u>
2. Cotton (canvas)				
a. 4'x12' HD canvas runner	\$12.50 ea	\$9.99 ea	\$9.85 ea	no bid ea
b. 5'x15' HD canvas runner	\$14.50 ea	\$14.99 ea	\$15.90 ea	no bid ea
c. 12'x15' HD canvas drop cloth 100% cotton, 12 oz.	\$48.50 ea	\$21.99 ea	\$24.95 ea	no bid ea

SAND PAPER SHEETS 3M production paper sheets,9"x11"

1. extra fine	usage 1,000	\$50.00 per 100	\$18.95 per 100	\$6.50 per 25	no bid per 25
2. fine	usage 1,000	\$46.00 per 100	\$29.00 per 100	\$10.50 per 120	no bid per 120
3. medium	usage 1,000	\$60.00 per 100	\$29.00 per 100	\$10.50 per 120	no bid per 120
4. coarse	usage 500	\$43.00 per 50	\$19.50 per 50	\$13.00 per 50	no bid per 50
5. extra coarse	usage 500	\$58.00 per 50	\$27.50 per 50	\$22.50 per 50	no bid per 50

EMERY CLOTH SHEETS AND CROCUS

CLOTH SHEETS 9" X 11"

1. fine	usage 500	\$76.00 per 50	\$42.50 per 50	no bid per 50	no bid per 50
2. medium	usage 500	\$105.00 per 50	\$44.50 per 50	no bid per 50	no bid per 50
3. coarse	usage 500	\$76.00 per 50	\$47.50 per 50	no bid per 50	no bid per 50
4. crocus	usage 500	\$74.50 per 50	\$48.50 per 50	no bid per 50	no bid per 50

#1 4" stain \$10

5" stain \$15

1" oil trim \$2.75

2" oil trim \$3.75

3" oil trim \$6.75

4" oil trim \$7.75

1½ sash china bristle \$3.75

2 sash china bristle \$4.50

1½ angular nylon/poly \$9.50

2 angular nylon/poly \$10.25

3 angular nylon/poly \$16.00