

BID # 15G70 - MASONRY MATERIALS

	Barasso & Sons, Inc.	F+D Supply Co. Inc	Century Building Materials	Contractors Markert, Inc
Item 1.				
Solid Block 4"				
unit price picked up	\$1.87	\$1.67	\$1.55	\$1.85
unit price delivered	\$2.57	\$1.87	\$1.55	\$1.95
Solid Block 6"				
unit price picked up	\$2.98	no bid	no bid	\$3.50
unit price delivered	\$4.28	no bid	no bid	\$3.60
Foundation Block 8"				
unit price picked up	\$1.97	\$1.97	\$1.65	\$1.85
unit price delivered	\$2.87	\$2.23	\$1.65	\$1.95
Item 2.				
Partition Block 4"				
unit price picked up	\$1.33	\$1.11	\$1.11	no bid
unit price delivered	\$1.86	\$1.25	\$1.25	no bid
Partition Block 6"				
unit price picked up	\$1.72	\$1.53	\$1.45	no bid
unit price delivered	\$2.32	\$1.73	\$1.45	no bid
Item 3.				
Insulated Block 8"				
unit price picked up	\$3.69	no bid	no bid	no bid
unit price delivered	\$4.69	no bid	no bid	no bid
Insulated Block 12"				
unit price picked up	\$5.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
unit price delivered	\$6.32	no bid	no bid	no bid

BID # 15G70 - MASONRY MATERIALS

	Barasso & Sons, Inc.	F+D Supply Co. Inc	Century Building Materials	Contractors Markert, Inc
Item 4.				
Expansion Joints 3" - 10 ft. lengths				
unit price picked up	\$3.25	\$3.00	\$1.70	\$2.20
unit price delivered	\$7.25	\$3.25	\$1.70	\$2.30
Expansion Joints 4" - 10 ft. lengths				
unit price picked up	\$3.75	\$3.75	\$2.20	\$2.50
unit price delivered	\$7.75	\$3.99	\$2.20	\$2.60
Expansion Joints 6" - 10 ft. lengths				
unit price picked up	\$4.75	\$4.99	\$3.20	\$3.25
unit price delivered	\$8.75	\$5.20	\$3.20	\$3.35
Item 5.				
Wire -- 6 X 6 X 6 X 6 - 750 S.F. Per Roll				
unit price picked up	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
unit price delivered	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Wire -- 6 X 6 X 10 X 10 - 750 S.F. Per Roll				
unit price picked up	\$112.00	\$87.00	\$87.95	\$90.00
unit price delivered	\$152.00	\$87.00	\$87.95	\$100.00
Wire -- 5 X 10 flat sheet				
unit price picked up	\$8.59	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$6.00
unit price delivered	\$28.59	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$6.50
Item 6.				
Cement - 94 lb bag				
unit price picked up	\$12.15	\$8.92	\$8.45	\$10.25
unit price delivered	\$14.40	\$8.92	\$8.95	\$10.35
Mortar Cement - 70 lb bag				
unit price picked up	\$9.50	\$7.49	\$6.95	\$9.00
unit price delivered	\$11.75	\$7.49	\$7.20	\$9.50

BID # 15G70 - MASONRY MATERIALS

	Barasso & Sons, Inc.	F+D Supply Co. Inc	Century Building Materials	Contractors Markert, Inc
Item 7.				
Bricks - red common clay				
unit price picked up	\$0.65	\$0.62	\$0.54	\$0.67
unit price delivered	\$0.80	\$0.62	\$0.54	\$0.72
Bricks - red common shale				
unit price picked up	\$0.49	\$0.58	\$0.48	\$0.80
unit price delivered	\$0.64	\$0.58	\$0.55	\$0.85
Discount				
%15 days			2%	2%
%30 days				