

BID #15G56 - ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

	<u>Greenvale Electric</u>	<u>Kelly & Hayes</u>	<u>Aetna Electrical</u>	<u>Avon Wesco</u>
ITEM #1 - ROMEX, B.X., T.H.H.N. & COPPER CABLE				
Price Per Foot (min order 500 ft)				
a. 6-3 U.F. w/g	\$1.48	no bid	\$2.99	\$1.98
b. 8-2 U.F. w/g	\$0.69	no bid	\$0.82	\$0.90
c. 8-3 U.F. w/g	\$1.02	no bid	\$1.24	\$1.36
d. 10-2 U.F. w/g	\$0.43	no bid	\$5.08	\$0.57
e. 10-3 U.F. w/g	\$0.62	no bid	\$6.55	\$0.82
f. 12-2 U.F. w/g	\$0.28	no bid	\$3.27	\$0.36
g. 12-3 U.F. w/g	\$0.39	no bid	\$4.75	\$0.52
h. 14-2 R.X. w/g	\$0.16	no bid	\$1.93	\$0.22
i. 14-3 R.X. w/g	\$0.23	no bid	\$2.75	\$0.30
j. 12-2 R.X. w/g	\$0.25	no bid	\$2.95	\$0.33
k. 12-3 R.X. w/g	\$0.35	no bid	\$5.25	\$0.46
l. 6-3 B.X. w/g	\$2.47	no bid	\$2.10	\$3.38
m. 14/2 B.X. w/g	\$0.34	no bid	\$4.25	\$0.45
n. 14/3 B.X. w/g	\$0.54	no bid	\$6.87	\$0.73
o. 12-2 B.X. w/g	\$0.34	no bid	\$4.25	\$0.45
p. 12-3 B.X. w/g	\$0.55	no bid	\$6.95	\$0.75
q. #14 Sol. THHN	\$0.05	no bid	\$0.07	\$0.069
r. #12 Sol. THHN	\$0.08	no bid	\$0.10	\$0.107
s. #10 Sol. THHN	\$0.12	no bid	\$0.15	\$0.166
t. #8 Str. THHN	\$0.23	no bid	\$0.28	\$0.303
u. #6 Str. THHN	\$0.35	no bid	\$0.41	\$0.466
v. #4 Str. THHN	\$0.54	no bid	\$0.88	\$0.721
w. #3 Str. THHN	\$0.68	no bid	\$1.03	\$0.90
x. #2 Str. THHN	\$0.85	no bid	\$1.03	\$1.13
y. #10 Str. TFFN	\$0.14	no bid	\$0.18	\$0.186
z. #16 Str. TFFN	\$0.05	no bid	\$0.02	\$0.06
zz.+250,000 MCM Copper Wire	\$3.11	no bid	\$3.90	\$4.15

BID #15G56 - ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

		<u>Greenvale</u>		<u>Kelly &</u>		<u>Aetna</u>		<u>Avon</u>	
		<u>Electric</u>		<u>Hayes</u>		<u>Electrical</u>		<u>Wesco</u>	
ITEM #2 CONDUIT									
Price per Foot (min order 100 ft)									
a. 1/2"	Rigid	\$104.66	100 ft	\$158.00	100 ft	\$1.22	per ft	\$1.44	per ft
	EMT	\$20.55	100 ft	\$28.75	100 ft	\$0.24	per ft	\$0.277	per ft
	PVC	\$15.00	100 ft	\$23.00	100 ft	\$0.18	per ft	\$0.198	per ft
b. 3/4"	Rigid	\$107.24	100 ft	\$164.00	100 ft	\$1.26	per ft	\$1.49	per ft
	EMT	\$35.55	100 ft	\$54.00	100 ft	\$0.41	per ft	\$0.479	per ft
	PVC	\$18.20	100 ft	\$26.00	100 ft	\$0.21	per ft	\$0.239	per ft
c. 1"	Rigid	\$160.73	100 ft	\$265.00	100 ft	\$1.87	per ft	\$2.21	per ft
	EMT	\$60.22	100 ft	\$88.00	100 ft	\$0.70	per ft	\$0.81	per ft
	PVC	\$26.47	100 ft	\$59.00	100 ft	\$0.31	per ft	\$0.35	per ft
d. 1 1/4"	Rigid	\$228.77	100 ft	\$348.00	100 ft	\$2.66	per ft	\$3.14	per ft
	EMT	\$97.75	100 ft	\$130.00	100 ft	\$1.13	per ft	\$1.32	per ft
	PVC	\$38.18	100 ft	\$78.00	100 ft	\$0.44	per ft	\$0.50	per ft
e. 1 1/2"	Rigid	\$252.59	100 ft	\$439.00	100 ft	\$3.00	per ft	\$3.55	per ft
	EMT	\$119.78	100 ft	\$165.00	100 ft	\$1.39	per ft	\$1.61	per ft
	PVC	\$43.92	100 ft	\$92.00	100 ft	\$0.51	per ft	\$0.57	per ft
f. 2"	Rigid	\$312.38	100 ft	\$490.00	100 ft	\$3.71	per ft	\$4.40	per ft
	EMT	\$141.26	100 ft	\$190.00	100 ft	\$1.63	per ft	\$1.90	per ft
	PVC	\$55.81	100 ft	\$120.00	100 ft	\$0.64	per ft	\$0.73	per ft
g. 2 1/2"	Rigid	\$594.90	100 ft	\$980.00	100 ft	\$6.92	per ft	\$8.20	per ft
	EMT	\$212.48	100 ft	\$310.00	100 ft	\$2.46	per ft	\$2.85	per ft
	PVC	\$89.25	100 ft	\$180.00	100 ft	\$1.03	per ft	\$1.17	per ft
h. 3"	Rigid	\$680.96	100 ft	\$1,190.00	100 ft	\$7.91	per ft	\$9.39	per ft
	EMT	\$272.44	100 ft	\$420.00	100 ft	\$3.15	per ft	\$3.67	per ft
	PVC	\$108.93	100 ft	\$228.00	100 ft	\$1.25	per ft	\$1.43	per ft
i. 3 1/2"	Rigid	\$885.79	100 ft	\$1,390.00	100 ft	\$10.28	per ft	\$12.21	per ft
	EMT	\$356.26	100 ft	\$470.00	100 ft	\$4.12	per ft	\$4.80	per ft
	PVC	\$135.35	100 ft	\$326.00	100 ft	\$1.59	per ft	\$1.81	per ft
j. 4"	Rigid	\$940.52	100 ft	\$1,680.00	100 ft	\$10.91	per ft	\$12.95	per ft
	EMT	\$367.28	100 ft	\$490.00	100 ft	\$4.25	per ft	\$4.94	per ft
	PVC	\$150.25	100 ft	\$330.00	100 ft	\$1.73	per ft	\$1.97	per ft

BID #15G56 - ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES

	<u>Greenvale Electric</u>	<u>Kelly & Hayes</u>	<u>Aetna Electrical</u>	<u>Avon Wesco</u>
ITEM #3 - SQUARE FIBERGLASS LIGHTING POLE				
15' each	no bid	\$660.00 ea-color	\$830.00 each	\$827.000 each
18' each	no bid	\$735.00 ea-color	\$925.00 each	\$886.000 each
ITEM #4 -				
Burndy Spantap Bugs #S4P28A (min order 50)	no bid	\$48.40 each	\$29.00 each	\$27.20 each
Burndy Tapit Bugs #UCG25RS (min order 100)	no bid	\$4.95 each	\$1.87 each	\$5.20 each
ITEM #5 -				
TBAA10 - Blackburn PAA10 400 TO 1/0 Aluminum parallel groove clamps Thomas & Betts or exact equal (min order 100)	\$5.04	\$7.65 each	\$7.95 each	\$6.75 each
Guarantee:	1 year	1 year		as per mfg