

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES

			HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
<u>BLADES:</u>						
1.	#10 SURGICAL BLADES	100/BOX	\$11.05	11.75	12.18	no bid
2.	CLIPPER BLADES	#10	\$19.75	21.95	19.76	no bid
		#15	\$19.75	14.95	19.76	no bid
		#40	\$19.75	21.95	19.76	no bid
3.	CLIPPER BLADE WASH	18 OZ.	\$ 5.75	5.65	5.71	no bid
4.	CLIPPER KOOLLUBE SPRAY	14 OZ.	\$6.51	6.50	5.08	no bid
5.	CLIPPER BLADE SPRAY		\$5.00	no bid	5.08	no bid
6.	CLIPPERCIDE	12 OZ	no bid	4.25	6.25	no bid
<u>GLOVES:</u>						
7.	GLOVE LATEX POWDER FREE					
	SMALL	100	\$4.85	6.49	4.89	no bid
	MEDIUM	100	\$4.85	6.49	4.89	no bid
	LARGE	100	\$4.85	6.49	4.89	no bid
8.	GLOVE EXAM VINLY LG	100	\$3.60	4.00	2.89	no bid
<u>AESTHETICS:</u>						
9.	LIDOCAINE HCL TOPICAL 4%	50ML	no bid	2.65	no bid	no bid
10.	NOLVASAN OINTMENT		no bid	15.22	6.47/16.68(4oz/16oz)	no bid
11.	NORMOSOL R 1000ML	12/CASE	\$68.00	64.62	60.00 14/case Plasma-Lyte	no bid no bid
<u>ANTIBIOTICS/ANTIFUNGAL/ANTIINFLAMMATORY:</u>						
12.	ALBON	16 OZ.	\$65.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
13.	AMPICILLIN 1GM, INJECTABLE	BOX OF 10 VIALS	\$20.50	2.35	12.95	no bid
14.	AMOXI DROPS (GENERIC)	50 MG/ML 15ML BOTTLE	\$4.00(Bromox)	4.00	3.88	no bid
		100MG 250 COUNT	\$81.05(500 Count)	no bid	78.68	no bid
		400MG 250 COUNT	\$135.85(200mg 500 Count)	no bid	no bid	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES			HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
15.	ANIMAX OINTMENT	7.5ML	\$3.25	no bid	3.13	no bid
		15ML	\$5.68	no bid	5.47	no bid
		30ML	\$8.75	no bid	4.81	no bid
		240ML	\$60.78	no bid	58.54	no bid
16.	(DERMALONE) Generic for Animax	7.5ML	\$3.25(Dermavet)	3.00	2.98	no bid
		15ML	\$5.68	5.25	5.20	no bid
		30ML	\$8.25	7.99	8.00	no bid
		240ML	\$60.78	55.95	55.75	no bid
17.	ANTIROBE AQUADROPS, 25MG/ML CAPSULES 150MG	20ML BOTTLES	\$2.73(Clindamicin)	no bid	2.73(clindamicin)	no bid
		100 COUNT	\$7.80	no bid	8.04	no bid
18.	ATARAX	10MG	\$17.75(500count)	2.97	20.45(hydrazine tabs)	no bid
		25MG	\$16.50(500count)	4.00	17.51	no bid
		50MG	\$23.70(500count)	4.75	6.21	no bid
19.	ATENOL	25MG 100 COUNT	\$1.75	1.20	2.74	no bid
		50MG 100 COUNT	\$1.75	1.35	2.77	no bid
20.	AZITHROMYCIN OS	200MG/5ML 30ML	\$16.60	14.95	15.50	no bid
21.	BAYTRIL TABS	22.7 MG	no bid	62.70	43.69	no bid
		68 MG	no bid	79.84	54.80	no bid
		136 MG	no bid	139.31	99.51	no bid
		INJECTABLE	no bid	35.24	24.78	no bid
22.	CARPROPHEN (RIMADYL)	25MG 180 COUNT	\$44.84	no bid	38.83	no bid
		50MG 180 COUNT	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		75MG 180 COUNT	\$48.60	no bid	49.41	no bid
		100MG 180 COUNT	\$59.42	no bid	58.82	no bid
23.	CEFA-DROPS	15ML BOTTLE	no bid	5.18	5.18	no bid
		50ML BOTTLE	no bid	15.53	15.53	no bid
24.	CEPHALEXIN	250MG 500 COUNT	\$22.05	25.42	25.23	no bid
		500MG 500 COUNT	\$34.40	32.95	39.64	no bid
25.	ORAL CHLORAMPHENICOL TABS	125MG/ML 100ML	\$16.50	11.99	15.10	no bid
		250MGM 500 COUNT	\$55.00	56.55	55.00	no bid
		500MGM 500 COUNT	\$107.95(Victor)	113.00	110.28	no bid
26.	CIPROFLOXCIN	IGR 500 COUNT	\$51.00	54.00	51.24	no bid
		25MG 100 COUNT	\$10.05(250mg)	9.85	11.48	no bid
		25MG 500 COUNT	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		50MG 100 COUNT	10.90(500mg)	9.40	10.23(500mg)	no bid
		OPHTHALMIC	\$2.08	2.35	2.20	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES

				HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
27.	CLAVAMOX	DROPS	15ML DOZEN	no bid	157.20	no bid	no bid
		TABS	125MG 210 CT	no bid	147.30	no bid	no bid
			250MG 210 CT	no bid	242.55	no bid	no bid
			375MG 210 CT	no bid	346.60	no bid	no bid
			62.5MG 210 CT	no bid	79.50	no bid	no bid
28.	CLINDADROPS		25MG/ML 20ML	\$2.73	2.99	2.83	no bid
29.	CLINDAMYCIN		25 MG CAPSULE	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
			150 MG CAPSULE	\$37.80(500count)	8.15	76.47	no bid
30.	CLINTABS		25MG TABLETS	no bid	116.00	no bid	no bid
31.	CONOFITE	LOTION 1%	30ML PER BOTTLE	no bid	no bid	4.08	no bid
		CREAM 2%	15GM TUBE	no bid	no bid	1.80	no bid
		SPRAY 1%	60ML BOTTLE	\$4.08	no bid	5.19	no bid
32.	DOXYCYCLINE TABS		50MG 500 COUNT	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
			100MG 500 COUNT	no bid	239.92	264.71	no bid
33.	GENTAMICIN OPTHALMIC			\$1.75	3.20	13.81	no bid
	INJECTABLE			\$23.85(100mg)	14.95	15.59	no bid
34.	LOXICOM (MELOXICAM) INJECTABLE		5MG/ML 20ML	\$140.00	131.41	131.41	no bid
35.	MAL-A-KET WIPES		50 COUNT	\$8.50	8.65	8.72	no bid
36.	METACAM ORAL SUSPENSION		100ML BOTTLE	no bid	70.00	51.50	no bid
		INJECTABLE		no bid	90.75	58.56	no bid
37.	METRONIDAZOLE TABS		250MG 500 COUNT	\$49.99	67.00	65.59	no bid
			500MG 500 COUNT	\$114.99	121.00	117.60	no bid
38.	MICONAZOLE NITRATE 2% CREAM		15GM	no bid	1.50	no bid	no bid
			30GM	\$2.23	no bid	1.08	no bid
39.	MICONAZOLE LOTION 1%		60ML	\$4.08	4.33	4.08	no bid
		SPRAY	4 OZ.	\$5.30	5.95	5.19	no bid
40.	MOMETAMAX		7.5ML	\$113.16	138.00	113.16	no bid
			15ML	\$169.32	206.00	162.32	no bid
			30ML	\$152.16	185.56	152.16	no bid
41.	MUPIROCIN OINTMENT USP 2%		22G	\$6.90	6.80	6.77	no bid
42.	NEOBACIMYX OPTHALMIC		3.5GM TUB	\$6.75(BNP)	no bid	2.14	no bid
		H OPTHALMIC	3.5GM TUBE	\$6.75	7.25	6.88	no bid
43.	NEO POLY BAC OO		3.5GM	\$6.75	6.94	6.88	no bid
44.	OFLOXACIN (OCUFLOX) OPHTHSOL		.3% 5ML	\$4.80	7.30	5.10	no bid
45.	ORBAX ORAL SUSPENSION		20ML 6/BOX	\$131.46	154.68	131.46	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES

			HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
46.	OTIBIOTIC OINTMENT	10gm generic	\$4.50(Triotic)	no bid	no bid	no bid
47.	POSATEX OTIC SUSPENSION	7.5ML 12/BOX	\$135.84	165.00	135.84	no bid
		15ML 12/BOX	\$203.40	247.92	203.40	no bid
		30ML 6/BOX	\$182.70	222.72	182.70	no bid
48.	SIMPLICEF	100MG	\$51.00(Cetpodotine)	110.05	58.76	no bid
		200MG	\$100.00	213.80	107.00	no bid
49.	SPORONOX ORAL SUSPENSION	10MG/ML 150ML	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
50.	VICETON TAB	500mg 500 COUNT	\$107.95	112.85	110.28	no bid
		250mg 500 COUNT	\$55.00	55.95	55.00	no bid
		1 GR 100 COUNT	\$51.00	no bid	51.24	no bid

SYRINGES/NEEDLES:

51.	CATH TERUMO WING 25G X 3/4		\$.30	.35	.30	no bid
52.	IV SET	MICRO	\$1.10(60drops)	1.00	1.92	no bid
		104IN 10DR 2YINJ PO LL	\$ 1.57(103 inch)	2.40	2.03	no bid
53.	IV CATHETER	18 GAUGE	\$.86	.80	.78	no bid
		20 GAUGE	\$.86	.80	.78	no bid
		22 GAUGE	\$.86	.80	.78	no bid
54.	NEEDLES, LOCKING	18 X 1	\$4.50	3.95	no bid	no bid
		18 x 1.5	\$4.50	3.95	no bid	no bid
		21 X 1	\$4.50	3.95	no bid	no bid
55.	NEEDLES, MONO 250 20 x 1/2	100	\$7.54	10.95	7.54	no bid
56.	NEEDLES, NIP 25 x 5/8"	100	\$4.50	3.95	3.19	no bid
57.	NEEDLES, TERUMO	18 X 11/2 /2 100	\$4.50	5.85	4.38	no bid
		20 X 1 100	\$4.50	10.95	4.38	no bid
		21 X 1 100	\$4.50	5.85	4.38	no bid
		22 X 1.5 100	\$4.50	no bid	4.38	no bid
		25 X 5/8 100	\$4.50	5.95	4.38	no bid
58.	SYRINGES, BD	3CC ORAML MED 100/BOX	\$10.85(monojet)	11.05	12.00	no bid
59.	SYRINGES, LOCKING	10 ML	\$9.84(Terumo)	10.95	9.06	no bid
		12 ML	\$16.31(monojet)	14.25	17.12	no bid
		20 ML	\$13.80 (Terumo)	no bid	11.18	no bid
60.	SYRINGES, SLIP TIP	1 ML	\$7.50(nipro)	6.95	no bid	no bid
		3 ML	\$5.15	4.99	no bid	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES**HSB Veterinary****Patterson****Merritt****Campbell**

61.	SYRINGES, EXCEL	12CC CURVED TIP 50/BOX	\$12.00	11.90	no bid	no bid
62.	SYRINGES, IDEAL	12CC LL 100/BOX	no bid	14.25	17.12	no bid
63.	SYRINGES, MONO	6CC LL 50/BOX	\$8.15	8.95	8.63	no bid
64.	SYRINGES, NIP	20CC LL 50/BOX	no bid	11.50	11.18	no bid
	TUBER	1CC 25 X 5/8 100/BOX	\$8.95	8.50	8.66	no bid
65.	SYRINGES, TERUMO	10CC LS 100/BOX	\$9.84	15.95	11.06	no bid
		3CC 22 X 3/4 LL 100/BOX	\$9.00	9.43	9.02	no bid
		3CC 25 X 5/8LL 100/BOX	\$9.00	9.45	9.02	no bid
	TUBER	1CC 25X5/8 100/BOX	\$8.95	15.25	9.28	no bid

BANDAGES:

66.	CAST PADDING	2" X 4 YDS 24 RLS	\$22.60	12.99	19.85	no bid
		3" X 4 YDS 12 RLS	\$16.75	8.85	15.56	no bid
		4" X 4 YDS 12 RLS	\$22.20	12.85	19.50	no bid
67.	CONFORM BAND	2" BG12 2242	\$2.75(Dynorex)	3.25	3.31	no bid
68.	COTTON ROLL	1 LB	\$4.25	3.50	3.77	no bid
69.	COTTON TUP APP PVS	1000	\$3.55	3.65	3.63	no bid
70.	ELASTIKON TAPE	2"	\$18.95	17.25	17.19	no bid
		3"	\$18.95	17.45	17.19	no bid
71.	ELASTIC BANDAGE TAPE	2" 6 rolls/box	\$11.40	10.25	no bid	no bid
		3" 4 rolls/box	\$10.50	8.95	no bid	no bid
72.	GAUZE	4"X4" BULK 4,000/case	\$37.90	75.00	64.20	no bid
73.	GAUZE CONFORM RL PVS	2" BG12	\$2.75	1.25	1.00	no bid
		3" BG12	\$2.00	1.75	1.46	no bid
74.	GAUZE BANDAGE BROWN	3" 12 ROLLS	\$4.92	4.45	4.73	no bid
75.	GAUZE SPONGE 3 X 3 12P	200	\$2.05	2.95	2.08	no bid
76.	KERLAX AMD GAUZE ROLL	4.5" X 4 YD	no bid	1.89	2.92	no bid
77.	KLING GAUZE ROLL	2" 12 COUNT	\$2.75	no bid	4.82	no bid
78.	PET-FLEX	3"X3" CLRPK 24/BOX	\$23.10(sensi wrap)	no bid	no bid	no bid
		2" CLRPK 36/BOX	\$24.06	no bid	29.75	no bid
		3" CLRPK 24/BOX	\$23.10	27.95	23.88	no bid
79.	TAPE – ELASTICON J&J	2" 6/BOX	\$18.95	17.25	17.19	no bid
		3" 4/BOX	\$18.95	17.45	17.19	no bid
80.	TAPE – ZONAS J&J	1" 12/BOX	\$13.95	12.95	12.89	no bid
		2" 6/BOX	\$13.95	12.95	12.89	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES

			HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
81.	TELFA-PADS	3X4 STERILE	100 COUNT \$6.99	16.85	no bid	no bid
		3 X 4	100 COUNT \$6.99	no bid	17.06	no bid
82.	ZONAS POROUS TAPE	1"	12/BOX \$13.95	no bid	no bid	no bid

FLEA/WORMS/TICKS TREATMENT/TESTS

83.	ADVANTAGE					
	DOG	0-10 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
	DOG	11-20 LBS	no bid	no bid	36.97	no bid
	DOG	21-55 LBS	no bid	no bid	37.69	no bid
	DOG	55 + UP	no bid	no bid	39.07	no bid
	CAT	0-05 LBS	no bid	no bid	30.82	no bid
	CAT	05-09 LBS	no bid	no bid	37.68	no bid
	CAT	09 + UP	no bid	no bid	37.68	no bid
84.	ADVANTAGE MULTI					
	DOG	3-09 LBS	no bid	no bid	62.61	no bid
	DOG	09-20 LBS	no bid	no bid	63.80	no bid
	DOG	20-55 LBS	no bid	no bid	66.18	no bid
	DOG	55-88 LBS	no bid	no bid	67.03	no bid
	DOG	88-110 LBS	no bid	no bid	70.19	no bid
	CAT	5-09 LBS	no bid	no bid	27.02	no bid
	CAT	09-18 LBS	no bid	no bid	62.55	no bid
85.	K9 ADVANTIX					
	DOGS – SMALL	02-10 LBS	no bid	no bid	42.46	no bid
	DOGS – MED	11-20 LBS	no bid	no bid	42.46	no bid
	DOGS – LARGE	21-54 LBS	no bid	no bid	43.54	no bid
	DOGS – XLARGE	55+	no bid	no bid	44.53	no bid
86.	CAPSTAR	ALL SIZES	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
87.	FRONTLINE PLUS	CANINE 89-132 RED	3PACK	no bid	\$76.50(6 pack)	no bid
88.	FRONTLINE SPRAY	250ML	6/CASE	no bid	25.47	no bid
89.	FREE FORM SNIP TIPS 3V CAPS	M/L DOG	60 COUNT	no bid	16.46	no bid
90.	HEART GUARD PLUS CHEWABLES-K9	51-100LBS	6 PACK	no bid	74.19	no bid
91.	IVERHART MAX	25.1-50	10/Sleeve	\$239.99	239.49	no bid
		50.1-100	10/Sleeve	\$289.99	289.99	no bid

BID FOR: <u>VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES</u>				HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
92.	NOROMECTIN 1% (IVERMECTIN) INJ	50ML	\$25.48	23.55	21.07	no bid	
93.	REGLAN INJ., GENERIC	2ML	no bid	1.45	34.59(box of 25)	no bid	
		10ML BOTTLE	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
94.	REVOLUTION						
	DOGS – MINI	00-05 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	DOGS – SMALL	05-10 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	DOGS – MED	10-20 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	DOGS – LARGE	20-40 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	DOGS – X-LARGE	40-85 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	DOGS – XX-LARGE	85 – 130 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	CATS – SMALL	00-05 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	CATS – MED	05-15 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	CATS – LARGE	15-22 LBS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
95.	PARVO SNAP TEST, WITNESS CPV STAT						
	CANINE PARVO VIRUS ANTIGEN TEST (GENERIC)		no bid	no bid	129.50	no bid	
96.	SNAP TEST						
	HEARTWORM RT TEST (30)		no bid	no bid	68.75	no bid	
	FELV ANTIGEN TEST (30)		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	FELV/FIV COMBO TEST (30)		no bid	no bid	337.50	no bid	

MISC MED SUPPLIES

97.	BOSTON RD	1 OZ +20MM CAP	100	\$26.90	11.45	14.66 (48)	no bid
		2 OZ +20MM CAP	100	\$36.72	13.85	6.25 (25)	no bid
98.	BOTTLE, SQUEEZE W/CAP	½ OZ		no bid	9.45	12.13 (48)	no bid
99.	BOUFFANT NURSE CAPS	100/BOX		\$3.63	4.50	3.65	no bid
100.	CAPILLARY TUBE SEALANT PAD			\$5.64	4.55	5.18	no bid
101.	COVERSLIDES	72/BOX		\$2.00	1.85	2.41 (100)	no bid
102.	COVERSLIP 22	1 OZ. BOX		\$2.00	no bid	no bid	no bid
103.	DERMATOPHYTE TEST MED	10/BOX		\$9.25	27.35	9.06	no bid
104.	DIP STAIN KIT	16 OZ. PER BOX		\$43.20	28.00	40.50	no bid
105.	DISPENSING VIALS AND BOTTLES (AMBER, PLASTIC)						
		SMALL		\$30.55(600)	34.00	no bid	no bid
		MEDIUM		\$28.16(320)	36.00	no bid	no bid
		LARGE		\$34.60(360)	60.00	no bid	no bid

BID FOR: <u>VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES</u>			HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
106.	EYE WASH	4OZ	\$1.89	1.91	1.99	no bid
107.	FCPS HALSTEAD	5" ST BL 200	\$8.50	3.45	4.00	no bid
108.	HEMOSTAT ECONOMY		\$2.90	18.00	no bid	no bid
109.	HEMA TUBE	HEP PRECAL100	\$3.50	5.75	5.18	no bid
		RED TIP	\$2.86	3.00	3.55	no bid
110.	HEPARINIZED GLASS	100	\$3.90	no bid	no bid	no bid
111.	HEMTOCRIT READER CARD		\$12.00	16.00	14.00	no bid
112.	HYDROGEN PEROXIDE	GALLON	no bid	4.60	4.20	no bid
113.	IMMERSION OIL	2 OZ. BOTTLE	\$12.95 (4oz)	13.75	12.95	no bid
114.	KWIK STOP SEPTIC POWDER	5 OZ. JAR	no bid	33.95	4.04	no bid
115.	LACTATED RINGERS	500ML BAG 24/case	no bid	no bid	114.17	no bid
		1,000ML BAG 12/case	no bid	64.62	63.00	no bid
116.	MICRO SLIDES PLAIN PVS	B X 72	\$2.00	2.75	2.00	no bid
117.	MULTISTIX,	10SG 100/BOX	\$30.00	20.00	30.59	no bid
118.	NURSER BOTTLES	2 OZ 12/BOX	\$8.40	8.75	8.47	no bid
119.	OVATECTOR KIT	100/BOX	\$65.00	57.95	67.80	no bid
120.	PEROXIDE	GALLON	no bid	4.60	no bid	no bid
121.	PILL COUNTER		\$16.00	9.75	16.00	no bid
122.	PLASTILITTER BLACK (LAB LITTER)	5LB GALLON	\$39.00	39.99	42.29	no bid
123.	POVIDONE IODINE, 10% SOLUTION	32 OZ.	\$20.35(gallon)	no bid	2.48	no bid
124.	Q-TIP BOX,	1,000/BOX	\$3.55	no bid	3.63	no bid
125.	SCALPEL HANDLE	#3 J55A	\$2.60	no bid	6.58	no bid
126.	SCAPEL BLADE STAINLESS SURGICAL					
		#10 MX4-310 100/BOX	\$9.95(dynarox)	25.95	40.00	no bid
		#15 MX4-315 100/BOX	\$9.95	25.95	40.00	no bid
127.	SCISSORS	BANDAGE	\$3.00	3.89	15.92	no bid
		SUTURE 4 1/2" BL50	\$3.00	1.99	21.32	no bid
128.	SHARPS CONTAINERS LARGE	8 QUART	no bid	5.85	3.56	no bid
		14 QUART	no bid	6.55	6.12	no bid
129.	SHERMAN TEAR TEST		\$49.60	49.60	44.60	no bid
130.	SHOE COVERS	100/BOX	\$10.00	17.99	9.38	no bid
131.	STAPLE REMOVER		\$5.50	no charge	3.88	no bid
132.	STERILE WATER	250ML BOTTLES	\$3.00	2.50	2.48	no bid
		500ML BOTTLES	no bid	2.99	no bid	no bid
133.	STERILE LUBE JELLY	5 OZ.	\$1.50(4ox dynalube)	1.99	1.65	no bid
134.	SUTURE REMOVER		\$3.00	no bid	no bid	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES

			HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
135.	SURGI LUBE		\$1.50(dynalube)	3.50	no bid	no bid
136.	THERMOMETER, DIGITAL,	FLEX TIP	\$5.50	5.25	no bid	no bid
		RIGID TIP	\$4.85	3.95	5.28	no bid
	SHEATHS, DIGITAL	100 PER BOX	\$8.50	3.00	no bid	no bid
137.	TIE ON MASK	50/BOX	\$2.45	3.95	2.95	no bid
138.	TONGUE DEPRESSORS PVS	500	\$3.60	3.55	3.63	no bid
139.	VETBOND GLUE	3ML	\$14.10	14.00	13.26	no bid
140.	VIALS 8DR D&D REV	COBALT BLUE CS410	no bid	35.25	22.42	no bid
	13DR D&D REV	COBALT BLUE CS275	no bid	31.95	21.23	no bid
141.	YELLOW ISOLATION GOWNS	5 BAGS/CASE	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		10 BAGS/CASE	\$18.50	48.00	15.30	no bid

EUTHANASIA MEDICINES:

142.	ACE-PROMAZINE INJECTIBLE	50ML bottle	no bid	14.50	15.28	no bid
	TABLETS	25 mg 100 bottle	no bid	33.80	33.40	no bid
		10 mg 100 bottle	no bid	23.95	22.70	no bid
143.	ANASED (XYLAZINE)	100ML BOTTLE	\$23.20	16.25	20.32	no bid
144.	BEUTHANASIA	100ML BOTTLE	\$56.70	48.20	48.20	no bid
145.	CYPROHEPTADINE, 4MG	100 COUNT	\$60.62	55.50	60.27	no bid
146.	EUTHANASIA SOLUTION VEDCO	10ML C3N ORM-D	\$39.95	40.40	40.39	no bid
147.	KETAMINE	100MG/ML 10ML C3N	\$5.40	no bid	5.46	no bid
	KETAVED (KETAMINE)	100MG/ML 10ML C3N	no bid	5.05	5.00	no bid
148.	PROMACE (ACEPROMAZINE MALEATE)					
	TABS	25MG 100 CNT	no bid	34.12	no bid	no bid
149.	TRAMADOL	50MG TABLETS 1000 CNT	\$25.60	30.14	25.08	no bid
150.	XYLAZINE	100mg/ml 50ml	\$24.95	no bid	20.32	no bid

MISCELLANEOUS MEDICINES:

151.	50% DEXTROSE INJECTABLE	500ML BOTILE	no bid	2.99	2.38	no bid
------	-------------------------	--------------	--------	------	------	--------

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES

				HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
152.	ACAREXX	BX/12x2		no bid	133.20	99.99	no bid
153.	ALBON TABS	250 MG	500 COUNT	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		500MG	500 COUNT	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
154.	ALCOHOL	70%	32oz	no bid	2.50	9.99(4qts)	no bid
155.	ALPHA TRACK GLUCOMETER STRIPS			no bid	45.00	43.20	no bid
				no bid	51.52	48.48	no bid
156.	BETAGEN SPRAY	120 oz.		\$6.60	7.50	7.35	no bid
157.	CERENIA	16MG		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		24MG		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		60MG		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		160MG		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		INJECTABLE		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		20ml vial		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
158.	COSEQUIN DBL STRENGTH	132 count		\$35.15 caps	35.15	35.15	no bid
159.	DERMACOOL	4 FL OZ		no bid	14.69	14.23	no bid
160.	COSYNTROPIN	INJECTABLE		no bid	64.55	63.60	no bid
161.	DEXAMETHAZONE	4MG	100ML	\$15.61	15.65	15.52	no bid
162.	DIAGEL						
	Cat/Small Dog	1 ml syringe	6-pack	no bid	52.00	51.95	no bid
	Dog Med	3 ml syringe	6-pack	no bid	57.00	50.40	no bid
	Dog Lg	5 ml syringe	6-pack	no bid	61.35	59.59	no bid
163.	DIPHENHYDRAMINE	50MG	10ML	\$10.45	10.25	10.46	no bid
		25mg		\$13.00(1,000)	1.99	1.84	no bid
164.	EICOSA CAPS	UP TO 40LBS	60 CAPS	\$9.59	10.50	8.50	no bid
		41-70 LBS	60 CAPS	\$13.19	16.46	12.05	no bid
165.	ENALAPRIL	2.5MG	100 TABLETS	\$12.75	10.15	12.23	no bid
		5MG	100 TABLETS	\$15.00	14.35	15.69	no bid
166.	ENERCAL VITAMEN SUPPLMT	5OZ		\$6.26(nutrical)	2.30	2.29	no bid
167.	ENULOSE SYRUP	16 OZ.		\$5.90	5.45	6.10	no bid
168.	ENDUROSYN CANINE ORAL GEL	32OZ.		no bid	12.45	no bid	no bid
	FELINE ORAL GEL	15GM		no bid	10.00	no bid	no bid
169.	FAMCICLOVIR	125MG		\$9.99	11.00	no bid	no bid
		250MG		\$10.95	no bid	no bid	no bid
		500MG		\$28.99	no bid	no bid	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES			HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
170.	FLUCONAZOLE	50MG	\$16.95	16.95	27.77	no bid
		100MG	\$26.81	74.00	42.00	no bid
		200MG	\$44.46	127.95	81.48	no bid
	ORAL	10MG/ML 2 OZ.	no bid	27.98	20.55	no bid
171.	FOR-BID	8 Grams Pack/12	\$16.10	11.85	12.37	no bid
172.	GRANULEX SPRAY		\$29.26	23.00	22.94	no bid
173.	GRISEOFULVIN LIQUID	125MG/ML 4 OZ.	\$9.24	7.95	9.24	no bid
174.	HYDROXYZINE	10MG 100 COUNT	\$4.00	2.99	20.45	no bid
		25MG 100 COUNT	\$4.55	4.00	11.52	no bid
		25MG 500 COUNT	\$18.99	17.95	17.51	no bid
		50MG 100 COUNT	\$6.00	4.55	6.21	no bid
		50MG 500 COUNT	\$26.99	25.25	34.94	no bid
175.	INJECTION PLUG LL MCGRAW	25 PER BOX	no bid	41.25(box)	16.48	no bid
176.	IVOMECTION INJECTABLE	50ML VIALS	\$25.48(noromectin)	33.30	no bid	no bid
		200ML VIALS	\$46.00(250ml)	99.38	no bid	no bid
		200ML VIALS	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
177.	ITRACONAZOLE	100 MG 30 CAPSULE	\$130.74	no bid	no bid	no bid
	ORAL SUSPENSION	50 MG/ML COMPOUNDED	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
178.	LACTULOSE	10 gm/ml 16 OZ. BOTTLE	\$5.90	no bid	no bid	no bid
179.	LASIX INJ.	50MGM/ML 50ML BOTL	no bid	no bid	13.92	no bid
180.	LAXATONE MALT	4.25 OZ.	\$6.05	6.44	5.55	no bid
181.	LIQUID/ARTIFICIAL TEARS	15ml	\$2.20	2.15	1.92	no bid
182.	LIME SULFER DIP	4 OZ	\$4.53	5.47	4.24	no bid
		GALLON	\$67.00	74.21	64.00	no bid
183.	LIMEPLUS DIP	16 OZ	\$9.95	10.50	9.04	no bid
184.	LOTENSIN (BENAZEPRIL)	5MG 100 COUNT	\$3.22	no bid	3.22	no bid
		10MG 100 COUNT	\$3.40	no bid	3.40	no bid
		20MG 100 COUNT	\$4.07	no bid	4.07	no bid
		40MG 100 COUNT	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
185.	METHIMAZOLE, 100'S 5MG	100 PER BOTTLE	\$4.38	5.45	4.65	no bid
186.	METOCLOPRAMIDE ORAL SOL	5MG/5ML 16 OZ.	\$5.72	5.50	no bid	no bid
187.	MILBEMITE	.25ML 2/PACK	no bid	no bid	125.50	no bid
188.	MINERAL OIL	GALLON	no bid	10.70	10.50	no bid
189.	MINOCYCLINE	5MG	\$28.66(50mg)	13.25	12.64	no bid
		100MG	\$11.80	136.95	14.60	no bid

BID FOR: <u>VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES</u>			HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
190.	MIRTAZAPINE	15MG	\$4.05	9.55	6.28	no bid
		30MG	\$5.60	13.00	no bid	no bid
191.	MITABAN DIP	10.6ML BOTTLE	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
192.	MITA CLEAR	22ML BOTTLE	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
193.	PEN PROCAIN	250 ML BOTTLE	\$10.31	8.90	7.65	no bid
194.	PEPCID, FAMOTIDINE					
	INJECTABLE	20 ml	no bid	8.25	12.69	no bid
	TABLETS	20MG 100 CNT	\$2.85	3.55	4.70	no bid
195.	PHENOBARBITOL 1/2 GRAIN	30MG 1,000 CNT	\$150.00	207.69	204.00	no bid
	1 GRAIN	60MG 1,000 CNT	\$180.00	253.28	255.00	no bid
196.	PREDNISONE	5MG 100 CNT	\$11.90	10.99	15.34	no bid
		10MG 100 CNT	\$9.25	12.99	12.52	no bid
		20MG 100 CNT	\$11.40	14.05	17.78	no bid
		10MG 500 CNT	\$81.95	no bid	157.50	no bid
		20MG 500 CNT	no bid	104.88	175.17	no bid
	ORAL LIQUID	15MG 5ML 8 OZ.	no bid	no bid	15.09	no bid
197.	PROPYLENE GLYCOL	GALLON	no bid	15.95	17.78	no bid
198.	PURALUBE OPHTHALMIC OINTMENT	1/8 OZ.	\$4.90	4.75	2.65	no bid
199.	SALIX (FUROSEMIDE) INJECTABLE	50ML	no bid	13.58	8.78	no bid
200.	SUCRALFATE TABS 1 GRAM	100 COUNT	\$21.90	17.45	23.47	no bid
201.	TERBUTALINE, 2.5MG TABS	100 COUNT BOTTLE	no bid	155.00	152.27	no bid
202.	TERRAMYACIN OPHTHALMIC	3.5GM TUBE	no bid	12.90	no bid	no bid
203.	THEOPHYLLINE TABLETS	100MG BOTTLE	\$39.60	33.65	35.50	no bid
204.	THYO TABS	.2MG 120 CNT	\$5.10	5.15	5.10	no bid
		.3MG 120 CNT	\$6.95	6.85	6.73	no bid
		.5MG 120 CNT	\$10.25	10.45	10.27	no bid
		.6MG 120 CNT	\$11.50	11.75	11.62	no bid
205.	TOBRAMYCIN OPHTH SOL	.3% 5ML	\$2.95	4.55	3.16	no bid
206.	TRESADERM	15ML	no bid	184.20	178.79	no bid
207.	TRIFECTANT 10#	TUB	\$92.00	99.86	85.77	no bid
208.	TRIPLE ANTIBIOTIC OPHTHALMIC					
	OINTMENT	1/8 OZ. TUBE	\$7.02	6.95	6.88	no bid
	DROPS		\$19.95	18.99	20.95	no bid
209.	TRI-OTIC	7.5 OZ.	\$3.95	no bid	3.68	no bid
210.	VETPROFEN	75MG 240 COUNT	\$75.00	no bid	70.59	no bid
		100MG 240 COUNT	\$95.00	no bid	89.20	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES**HSB Veterinary****Patterson****Merritt****Campbell****TOPICALS/OINTMENTS/CREAMS:**

211.	CHLOROHEXADERM MAX	4%	GALLON	no bid	25.95	39.99	no bid
212.	CHLOROHEXIDINE SOLUTION	2%	GALLON	\$9.95	7.99	19.17	no bid
213.	ERYTHROMYCIN OPHTHALMIC OINTMENT			\$8.25	8.45	9.93	no bid
214.	OPTIMMUNE OPHTHALMIC	3.5GM TUBE	6/CASE	\$147.36	125.22	125.22	no bid
215.	PETROLATUM/PURALUBE OO			\$4.90	4.75	no bid	no bid
216.	RELIEF CREAM RISE	8 OZ.		no bid	8.90	6.89	no bid

DEWORMERS:

217.	DRONTAL INJECTABLE FOR DOGS & CATS		10ML	no bid	no bid	91.21	no bid
218.	DRONTAL TABLETS	FELINE	18.2MG	50 COUNT	no bid	161.14	161.14
		CANINE	22.7MG	50 COUNT	no bid	119.88	148.29
		CANINE	68.0MG	50 COUNT	no bid	385.77	385.77
		CANINE	136MG	30 COUNT	no bid	416.27	416.27
219.	PANACUR	GRANULES	1 LB. TUB	\$318.00	32.30	270.30	no bid
	PANACUR C 2GM DISP GREEN	10/3PK (FENBENDAZOLE)		\$57.87	49.13	49.13	no bid
	PANACUR SUSPENSION (FENBENDAZOLE)		1000ML	no bid	no bid	105.10	no bid
220.	PRAZI Q INJECTABLE		50ML BOTTLE	\$293.90	no bid	261.10	no bid
221.	PYRANTHEL PAMOATE (EXODUS)	32 OZ. (QUART)		\$25.56	no bid	21.13	no bid
222.	STRONGID T	32 OZ. (QUART)		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

SHAMPOOS/CLEANERS:

223.	ANM ALOE & OATMEAL RINSE		GALLON	\$35.01	41.40	24.25	no bid
224.	BENZOYL-PEROXIDE SHAMPOO	2.5%	GALLON	\$88.23	70.55	51.12	no bid
225.	DERMA BENS SHAMPOO		12 OZ.	\$9.75	10.02	10.02	no bid
226.	EPI-OTIC		16 OZ. BOTTLE	\$15.60	no bid	15.60	no bid
	ADVANCED		16 OZ. BOTTLE	\$8.25	no bid	no bid	no bid
227.	EPISOOOTHE OATMEAL SHAMPOO		16 OZ.	\$11.95	no bid	11.95	no bid
228.	KERATOLUX SHAMPOO		16 OZ.	\$16.05	no bid	16.05	no bid
			8 OZ. BOTTLE	\$8.80	no bid	8.80	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES

			HSB Veterinary	Patterson	Merritt	Campbell
229.	MP BENZOYL-PLUS SHAMPOO	12 OZ.	\$7.05	no bid	11.25	no bid
230.	OTOMAX	7.5GM TUBE 12/CS	\$89.04	104.76	89.04	no bid
231.	OXYDEX SHAMPOO	GALLON	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
232.	SHAMPOO, UNIVERSAL MEDICATED	GALLON	\$78.13	78.13	71.70	no bid
233.	TRIZEDTA AQUEOUS	4 OZ.	\$8.25	8.72	7.95	no bid
		16 OZ.	\$16.05	16.84	15.35	no bid

VITAMINS/SUPPLEMENTS/Puppy&Kitten Milk:

234.	BENE BAC PET GEL	15GM	\$4.60	4.20	4.09	no bid
235.	BETADINE SOLUTION (GENERIC)	GALLON	\$19.10	26.00	19.71	no bid
236.	ESBILAC	8 OZ. LIQ CAN	\$1.92	1.95	1.89	no bid
		12 OZ. PWDR CAN	\$10.810	10.95	10.60	no bid
237.	KMR POWDER	12 OZ.	\$11.50	13.00	11.46	no bid
238.	CHLORHEXIDINE SOLUTION 2%	GALLON	\$10.90	6.20	10.91	no bid
239.	FECALYZER	50 COUNT	\$29.99	29.99	7.06	no bid
240.	FECAL DIAGNOSTIC KITS	50 COUNT	\$7.58	9.95	no bid	no bid
241.	FECASOL LIQUID	1 GALLON	\$24.63	24.63	9.73	no bid
242.	FELIMAZOLE	2.5MG	100 cnt\$8.12	8.62	8.12	no bid
		5MG	100 cnt\$12.96	13.78	12.96	no bid
243.	FORCEPS HALSTEAD MOSQ STR	5" VANTAGE	\$3.50	3.25	3.60	no bid
244.	L-LYSINE,	500MG CAPS	100 cnt no bid	4.40	no bid	no bid
245.	NUTRICAL GEL	4 ¼ OZ. TUBE	\$5.99	6.26	5.90	no bid
246.	PET TINIC	2 OZ.	no bid	no bid	7.71	no bid
	IRON PLUS	4 OZ.	no bid	5.77	5.33	no bid
247.	PROIN 50	180 COUNT	\$31.87	39.00	no bid	no bid
248.	PURINA FORTIFLORA					
	CANINE 30 POUCHES/BOX	6 BOX/CASE	no bid	104.33	no bid	no bid
	FELINE 30 POUCHES/BOX	6 BOX/CASE	no bid	104.33	no bid	no bid
249.	VITAMIN B COMPLEX 150					
	INJECTABLE BOTTLE	100ML	no bid	8.25	3.24	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES

HSB Veterinary

Patterson

Merritt

Campbell

VACCINES:

250.	NOBIVAC	3-RABIES	50 X 1DS	Honor	86.50	86.50	no bid
		CANINE 1-DAPPV	25 X 1DS	Merck	55.25	55.25	no bid
		CANINE FLU H3N8	25 X 1DS	Pricing	85.00	85.00	no bid
		FELINE 1-HCP	25 X 1DS		34.00	34.00	no bid
		FELINE BB	25 X 1DS		112.50	112.50	no bid
		INTRA TRAC3 ADT	25 X 0.5ML		94.25	94.25	no bid
251.	ZOETIS	CONVENIA INJECTIBLE					
		.23 ml			no bid	no bid	no bid
		.45 ml			no bid	no bid	no bid
		.67 ml			no bid	no bid	no bid
		.90 ml			no bid	no bid	no bid
		1.8 ml			no bid	no bid	no bid
		3.6 ml			no bid	no bid	no bid
252.	ZOETIS	BORDETELLA (BRONCHICINE)	10 dose vial		no bid	no bid	no bid

MICROCHIPPING:

253.	Home Again Microchips & Enrollment	200 count		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
254.	Microchip Scanners	each		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
255.	INDICATE % OFF VACCINES	NOT LISTED IN BID		5%	no bid	no bid	no bid
256.	INDICATE % OFF MEDICINE	NOT LISTED IN BID		5%	no bid	no bid	no bid
257.	INDICATE % OFF MEDICAL SUPPLIES	NOT LISTED IN BID		5%	no bid	no bid	no bid

BID FOR: VETERINARY MEDICAL AND PET SUPPLIES

HSB Veterinary

Patterson

Merritt

Campbell

PET SUPPLIES:

258.	Leashes – 4 ft rope round, assorted colors	500 count	\$.45	no bid	7.20(blue&white12pks)	.65¢	
259.	Cat Carriers, one piece cardboard (up to 45 lbs)	60 count	\$82.00(20 count)	no bid	30.20	4.38	
260.	Pooper Scooper, w/alum handle – LG (11"W x 9"D)						
	3 ft rake	3 count	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	3 ft spade	3 count	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	4 ft rake	3 count	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	4 ft spade	3 count	no bid			no bid	
261.	Pooper Scooper, Flexrake w/alum handle – LG (11"W x 9"D)						
	(blue, purple, raspberry)	3 count	no bid	no bid	no bid	.63¢	
262.	Rabies Tags – aluminum	100 count	no bid	no bid	32.00	.07¢	
263.	D-Rings for Rabies Tags	100 count	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
264.	Muzzle Set – lined muzzles, 12 assorted sizes in 1 pack	1-12 pack	no bid	no bid	45.50(1-10)	no bid	
265.	TNR Cat Traps						
	36 X 10 X 12 (1 X 1 - 14 gauge powder coated)		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	36 X 36 X 14 (collapsible drop 1 X 2 - 12 gauge powder coated)		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	Drop trap spring clip		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
266.	Standard Dura-Flex Net						
	with 3' Handle		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	with 4' Handle		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
	with 5' Handle		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
267.	Nail Scissor		no bid	no bid	6.78	no bid	
268.	Scrub Brush Super		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
269.	Ticked Off Tick Remover		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	
270.	INDICATE % OFF PET SUPPLIES (catalog prices) NOT LISTED IN BID						
	Catalog bid	%	5%	no bid	no bid	no bid	