

**Bid No. 15G48-PURCHASE OF LIGHTPOLES, FIXTURES & BOLLARDS, MAGNIFLOOD OR EQUAL**

	Magniflood Inc.		Kelly & Hayes Supply
Items:			
1. Wellwood Bollard with GFI Receptacle	\$685.00	Unit Price	no bid
2. James Madison Light Pole – 10 ft. SM661A -10	\$1,025.00	Unit Price	no bid
3. James Madison Light Pole – 12 ft. SM661A-12	\$1,050.00	Unit Price	no bid
4. James Madison Light Pole – 14 ft. SM661A-14	\$1,075.00	Unit Price	no bid
5. Anchor Bolts – SM661AB	\$55/per set of 4		no bid
6. Aluminum Madison Pier Mount	\$95.00	Unit Price	no bid
7. Parklite-2 LEDC 49 Post-Top Luminaire	\$735.00	Unit Price	no bid
8. Montauk Carriage House Post Top Luminaire			
Metal Halide Post Light                      SM661b	\$675.00	Unit Price	no bid
9. Flag Holder – SM661FH	\$90.00	Unit Price	no bid
10. Plant Holder – SM661PH	\$150.00	Unit Price	no bid
11. Banner Arm – (2 per Pole)	\$150.00/2	Unit Price	no bid
12. Shakespeare Light Pole – 18 ft.	no bid		\$930.00
13. Shakespeare Light Pole – 20 ft.	no bid		\$1,025.00
14. Bullhorn Brackets, 2 in-line mounting	BL-22      \$230.00	Unit Price	\$535.00
15. Post Light Bayville, L4S150/55	\$495.00	Unit Price	no bid
16. Magni-lite Floodlight As-150/44	\$395.00	Unit Price	no bid
17. Roadway Lights Parkway SPS-150	\$435.00	Unit Price	no bid
	Manufacturer Magniflood as specified		items 12/13/14 shakespeare