

BID #15G40 - FINE SCREENED TOPSOIL, GENERAL ALL PURPOSE TOPSOIL, CLAYS AND BASEBALL MIXES

	<u>Bittle and Sons</u>	<u>Bissett Nursery</u>	<u>All Pro Horticulture</u>	<u>Custom Clay</u>	<u>Primetime</u>	<u>Barbato Nursery</u>	<u>Watral Brothers</u>
1. Fine Screened Topsoil (c.y.)	\$14.72	no bid	no bid	\$18.00	\$8.50	\$15.00	\$9.93
2. All Purpose Topsoil (c.y.)	\$14.72	\$19.52	no bid	\$18.00	\$8.50	\$10.00	\$9.93
3. Orange Clay (c.y.)	no bid	\$71.67	no bid	\$40.00	no bid	\$36.65	\$29.93
4. Red Clay (c.y.)	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$71.50	no bid	\$72.85	no bid
5. Mound Clay Block Moundmaster Turface of equal Mfg 8 brick set	no bid	no bid	Moltan \$14.95	no bid	no bid	Turface \$19.95	no bid
6. Mound Clay Turface of equal Mfg 50 lb bag	no bid	no bid	Moltan \$15.95	no bid	no bid	Turface MVP \$18.95	no bid
7. Baseball Diamond Mix Beam Clay or equal Mfg unit price (c.y.)	no bid	no bid	no bid	Custom Clay \$40.00	no bid	Custom Clay \$39.95	no bid
8. Baseball Infield Mix Beam Clay or equal Mfg unit price (c.y.)	no bid	no bid	no bid	Custom Clay \$40.00	no bid	Custom Clay \$36.65	no bid