

BID #14G86 - PURCHASE OF DECORATIVE BANNERS

	Gates Flag & Banner	Agas Mfg	Project Graphics	Quinn Flags	ConServ Flag Co.	All Flag & Flagpoles	
<b><u>Banners</u></b>							
1. 50 - 100 Banners	\$32.00	\$21.50	\$29.05	\$47.24	\$122.00	\$106.80	
2. 101 - 150 Banners	\$30.00	\$20.00	\$22.51	\$37.23	\$112.00	\$96.00	
3. 151 - 200 Banners	\$28.00	\$19.00	\$19.99	\$33.63	\$112.00	\$84.00	
4. 201 - 250 Banners	\$26.00	\$18.25	\$19.23	\$31.32	\$105.00	\$78.00	
5. 251 and Over	\$24.00	\$17.95	\$17.99	\$30.39	\$105.00	\$76.80	
<b><u>Installation only (of purchased banners)</u></b>							
6. 50 - 100 Banners	\$19.00	\$1,200.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$30.00	per banner
7. 101 - 150 Banners	\$18.50	\$1,600.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$28.80	per banner
8. 151 - 200 Banners	\$18.00	\$1,600.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$26.40	per banner
9. 201 - 250 Banners	\$17.50	\$2,000.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$24.00	per banner
10. 251 and Over	\$17.00	\$3,000.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$24.00	per banner

note: artwork  
must be supplied camera  
ready Vector format