

BID #14G07 - SILK SCREENING: TOWN OF BABYLON RECREATION PERMITS

	Direct Mail Works	Dri-Stick d/b/a Rydin Decal**		Morgan Electronics
PARKS DEPT PERMITS				
<u>Item#1 - Recreation Permits</u>				
19600 (price each)	\$0.53	\$0.55		no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge	included	included		
One Time Set Up Charge	included	included		
<u>Item#2 - Resident Permits</u>				
250 (price each)	no bid	\$0.55		no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		
<u>Item#3 - Volunteer Fire Department Permits</u>				
1000 (price each)	no bid	\$0.55		no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		
SANITATION DEPARTMENT				
<u>Item#4 - Vehicle Permit - light blue</u>				
50 (price each)	no bid	\$4.21	***	\$1.52
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		n/c
One Time Set Up Charge		included		n/c
<u>Item#5 - Vehicle Permit - yellow</u>				
250 (price each)	no bid	\$1.23	***	\$1.52
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		n/c
One Time Set Up Charge		included		n/c
<u>Item#6 - Class 1 Container Permit</u>				
800 (price each)	no bid	\$0.58	***	\$0.72
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		n/c
One Time Set Up Charge		included		n/c
<u>Item#7 - Class 2 Container Permit</u>				
125 (price each)	no bid	\$1.97	***	\$1.52
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		n/c
One Time Set Up Charge		included		n/c
<u>Item#8 - Class 3 Container Permit</u>				
2500 (price each)	no bid	\$0.45	***	\$0.72
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		n/c
One Time Set Up Charge		included		n/c
<u>Item#9 - Class 4 Container Permit</u>				
75 (price each)	no bid	\$2.36	***	\$0.72
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		n/c
One Time Set Up Charge		included		n/c

BID #14G07 - SILK SCREENING: TOWN OF BABYLON RECREATION PERMITS

	Direct Mail Works	Dri-Stick d/b/a Rydin Decal**		Morgan Electronics
TOWN CLERKS PERMITS & LICENSES				
<u>Item#10</u> Master Plumbers License				
300 (price each)	no bid	\$1.04	***	no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		
<u>Item#11</u> Restricted Plumber License				
250 (price each)	no bid	\$1.08	***	no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		
<u>Item#12</u> Landscapers License				
500 (price each)	no bid	\$0.95	***	no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		
<u>Item#13</u> Boat Berth Permit				
200 (price each)	no bid	\$2.22		no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		
<u>Item#14</u> Tow Truck Permits				
100 (price each)	no bid	\$5.96		no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		
<u>Item#15</u> Cedar: Campground & Marina Parking Permits				
300 (price each)	no bid	\$1.86		no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		
<u>Item#16</u> Jet Ski Permit				
400 (price each)	no bid	\$1.64		no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		
<u>Item#17</u> Docking/Launch Permit				
1600 (price each)	no bid	\$0.90		no bid
One Time Die Cutting Charge		included		
One Time Set Up Charge		included		

*In addition Rydin stated the following on their bid:

If items 4-9 are ordered at the same time, unit price for all would be \$0.50

If items 10-12 are ordered at the same time, unit price for all would be \$0.90