

BID #12G10- PRINTING, LETTERHEAD, ENVELOPES, RECEIPTS, ETC.

		<u>Precision Envelope</u>	<u>Denton Advertising</u>	<u>Morgan Electronics</u>	<u>Design 2 Printing Inc</u>	<u>Gallery Digital</u>	<u>Lotus events</u>	<u>Graphic Image, Inc.</u>
1a. Letterhead - 8 1/2" x 11" Envelopes	per 1000	\$ 65.00	\$ 65.00	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 49.25	\$ 60.00
1b. 4 1/8" x 9 1/2" No. 10 Window	per 1000	\$ 31.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 60.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 53.00
1c. 4 1/8" x 9 1/2" White wove bond	per 1000	\$ 30.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 55.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 51.00
1d. 4 1/8" x 9 1/2" window 4/12" x 1 1/8" positioned 7/8" from right and 1/2" from bottom	per 1000	\$ 31.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 36.50	\$ 32.00	\$ 50.00
1e. 4 1/2" x 9 1/2" 24 lb white woven self addressed return envelope - Town Clerk	per 1000	\$ 30.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 48.00
1f. 3 5/8" x 6 1/2" window 1 1/4" x 4 1/2" positioned 7/8" from left side and 1/2" from bottom-tax receiver	per 1000	\$ 31.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 65.00	no bid	\$ 31.00	\$ 44.00
1g. 3 5/8" x 8 5/8" window 1 1/8" x 4 1/2" positioned 1" from left side and 3/4" from bottom - Comptroller	per 1000	\$ 36.50	no bid	no bid	\$ 55.00	no bid	\$ 36.00	\$ 48.00
1h. 9 1/2" x 12 1/2" Gray Kraft stock, gummed flap self-addressed return envelope	per 2500	\$ 397.60	\$ 570.00	no bid	\$ 345.00	no bid	\$ 312.00	\$ 370.00
1i. 9" x 12" Kraft stock, gummed flap, printing on side	per 2000	\$ 204.00	\$ 260.00	no bid	\$ 210.00	no bid	\$ 170.00	\$ 240.00
1j. 10" x 15" Kraft stock, gummed flap, printing two sides, - building permit folder	per 2000	\$ 321.00	\$ 637.00	no bid	\$ 395.00	no bid	\$ 240.00	\$ 380.00
1k. 10" x 15" Kraft stok, gummed flap, printing one side - sign permit folder	per 2000	\$ 321.00	\$ 495.00	no bid	\$ 290.00	no bid	\$ 200.00	\$ 360.00
1l. 10" x 15" Kraft stock, gummed flap, printing one side - Zoning Board of Appleals	per 2000	\$ 321.00	\$ 495.00	no bid	\$ 290.00	no bid	\$ 232.00	\$ 360.00
1m. 10" x 15" Kraft Stock, gummed flap, printing one side - rental/accessory apt. review board	per 2000	\$ 321.00	\$ 595.00	no bid	\$ 365.00	no bid	\$ 200.00	\$ 390.00
1n. 4 1/8" x 9 1/2" No. 10 Window, Sub.24 - green ink	per 1000	\$ 89.95	no bid	no bid	\$ 82.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 60.00
1o. 3 7/8" x 8 7/8" white woven, self addressed return envelope incl bar code - green ink	per 1000	\$ 93.50	no bid	no bid	\$ 77.00	no bid	\$ 31.00	\$ 50.00
1p. 9 1/2" x 12 1/2" Gray Kraft stock, gummed flap Town Clerk in return address	per 2500	\$ 397.60	\$ 570.00	no bid	\$ 140.00	no bid	\$ 313.00	\$ 340.00
<u>Cards & Tickets</u>								
2a. 2" x 3 1/2" White card stock	per 1000	\$ 33.10	\$ 33.00	no bid	\$ 32.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 48.00
2b. 2" x 3 1/2" white card stock printed 2 sides	per 1000	\$ 59.00	\$ 48.00	no bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 49.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 58.00
2c. 2" x 3 7/8" rounded corners, blue stock Senior Citizens	per 500	\$ 69.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 65.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 58.00
<u>Directory cards</u>								
2d. 4" x 9" white 110 lb Index Card Stock, 2-sided-Supervisr	per 1000	\$ 71.00	\$ 75.00	no bid	\$ 70.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 74.00

BID #12G10 - PRINTING, LETTERHEAD, ENVELOPES, RECEIPTS, ETC.

		<u>Precision Envelope</u>	<u>Denton Advertising</u>	<u>Morgan Electronic</u>	<u>Design 2 Printing Inc</u>	<u>Gallery Digital</u>	<u>Lotus Events</u>	<u>Graphic Image, Inc.</u>	
<u>Achievement, Community Service Award & Merit Certificate</u>									
3a.	8 3/8" x 10 7/8" GOES 746, black ink - Town Council	per 1000	\$ 249.00	no bid	no bid	\$ 275.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 189.00	\$ 220.00
<u>RECEIPT BOOKS & NCR SETS</u>									
<u>Town Clerk Receipt Book</u>									
4a.	Receipt 2 12" x 6" - Book 12 1/2" H x 7" W, NCR 2 part, 5 perforated receipts to page. 1 page stationary. Color choice 250 receipts per book. Consecutively numbered, wrap around with additional cover w/printed title & book number	per 40	no bid	no bid	\$ 589.00	\$ 725.00	\$ 610.00	\$ 567.00	\$ 660.00
<u>Ordinance Enforcement Summons book</u>									
4b.	5 1/2" x 8 1/2" 3 page NCR, white, yellow, pink perforated at top, consecutively numbered 50 sets per book	per 40	\$ 321.00	\$ 350.00	\$ 219.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 595.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 220.00
<u>Sign Permit book</u>									
4c.	6 1/2" x 9 1/2" 3 page NCR, white, yellow, pink perforated at top, consecutively numbered 25 sets per book	per 40	\$ 229.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 218.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 149.00	\$ 300.00
<u>Rental Inspection Checklist</u>									
4d.	8 1/2" x 11" 2 page NCR sets, white, pink	per 1000	\$ 139.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 118.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 108.00	\$ 170.00
<u>Accessory Apartment Checklist</u>									
4e.	8 1/2" x 11" 2 page NCR sets, white, pink	per 1000	\$ 139.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 118.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 108.00	\$ 170.00
<u>Certificate of Occupancy</u>									
4f.	8 1/2" x 11" NCR 2 page sets blue & pink consecutively numbered	per 1500	\$ 225.00	\$ 235.00	\$ 194.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 212.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 230.00
<u>Accessory Apt. Permit</u>									
4g.	8 1/2" x 11" NCR 3 page sets, white, yellow, pink	per 1500	\$ 225.00	\$ 233.00	\$ 194.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 212.00	\$ 210.00	\$ 270.00

BID #12G10 - PRINTING, LETTERHEAD, ENVELOPES, RECEIPTS, ETC.

		<u>Precision Envelope</u>	<u>Denton Advertising</u>	<u>Morgan Electronic</u>	<u>Design 2 Printing Inc</u>	<u>Gallery Digital</u>	<u>Lotus Events</u>	<u>Graphic Image, Inc.</u>
<u>Building Permit</u>								
4h. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 4 page sets white,yellow, pink,white consecutively numbered	per 1500	\$ 259.00	\$ 295.00	\$ 237.00	\$ 241.00	\$ 265.00	\$ 237.00	\$ 320.00
<u>Permit for Rental Premises</u>								
4i. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 2 page sets white, yellow consecutively numbered	per 1000	\$ 140.00	\$ 155.00	\$ 118.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 129.00	\$ 117.00	\$ 190.00
<u>Notice of Illegal Structure</u>								
4j. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 3 page sets white, yellow, pink	per 1000	\$ 148.00	\$ 178.00	\$ 128.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 138.00	\$ 127.00	\$ 180.00
<u>Incomplete Application (plans examination)</u>								
4k. 8 1/2: x 11" NCR 2 page set white, yellow	per 1000	\$ 115.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 118.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 129.00	\$ 108.00	\$ 190.00
<u>Inspection</u>								
4l. 8 1/2" x 6" NCR 2 page sets pale green, 2nd page index	per 2000	\$ 239.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 157.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 158.00	\$ 190.00
<u>Inspection request</u>								
4m. 8 1/2" x 6" NCR 2 page sets, white, 2nd page index sto	per 2000	\$ 239.00	\$ 285.00	\$ 157.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 158.00	\$ 190.00
<u>Denial of permit</u>								
4n. 8 1/2" x 14" NCR 2 page sets, pink, yellow	per 1000	\$ 219.00	\$ 228.00	\$ 118.00	\$ 125.00	\$ 129.00	\$ 114.00	\$ 170.00
4o. 8 1/2" x 14" NCR 3 page sets white, yellow, pink	per 1000	\$ 223.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 138.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 151.00	\$ 137.00	\$ 190.00
<u>Fire Marshals Office receipt books</u>								
4p. 8 1/2" x 5 1/2" NCR 3 page sets, 2 pages perforated, 1 stationery, white,yellow,pink, consecutively numbered 25 per book, covered front & back index stock, bound edge additional 3/4". Paper std #16	per 40	\$ 254.00	\$ 290.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 227.00	\$ 240.00

BID #12G10 - PRINTING, LETTERHEAD, ENVELOPES, RECEIPTS, ETC.

		<u>Precision Envelope</u>	<u>Denton Advertising</u>	<u>Morgan Electronic</u>	<u>Design 2 Printing Inc</u>	<u>Gallery Digital</u>	<u>Lotus Events</u>	<u>Graphic Image, Inc.</u>
<u>Fire Marshals Office Inspection reports</u>								
4q. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 3 page sets, 20 lb weight, 2 perforated 1 stationary, white,blue,yellow, consecutively numbered 25 perbook, cover front & back index stock, bound edges to be additional 3/4". Paper std. #16.	per 40	\$ 310.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 368.00	\$ 370.00	\$ 395.00	\$ 368.00	\$ 360.00
<u>Fire Marshals Office Permit books</u>								
4r. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 3 page sets, green,white,pink 2 pages perforated, 1 stationary, 25 per book, covered front and back index stock, bound additional 3/4", consecutively numbered. Paper std. #16.	per 40	\$ 246.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 247.00	\$ 280.00
<u>D.P.W. Sewer Excavation permit</u>								
4s. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 4 page sets white,yellow,pink,gold	per 1000	\$ 187.88	\$ 230.00	\$ 166.00	\$ 198.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 185.00	\$ 240.00
<u>D.P.W. Defect Report</u>								
4t. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 2 page sets white, blue	per 1000	NO BID	\$ 120.00	\$ 122.00	\$ 124.00	\$ 129.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 130.00
<u>D.P.W. Excavation in streets permit application</u>								
4u. 8 1/2" x 14" NCR 4 page sets white, yellow, pink, gold	per 1000	\$ 214.00	\$ 229.00	\$ 190.00	\$ 230.00	\$ 215.00	\$ 245.00	\$ 290.00
<u>D.P.W. Excavation in streets permit</u>								
4v. 8 1/2" x 11" NCR 3 page sets white,yellow,blue, 2 3/4" bottom portion perforated in triplicate.Consecutively numbered tops and bottoms. 25 sets per book. Cardboard backing with 3/4" bound edge printed title & book number	per 1000	\$ 262.00	no bid	\$ 248.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 272.00	\$ 245.00	\$ 330.00
<u>Purchasing Requisitions</u>								
4w. 8 1/2" x 14" NCR 2 page sets pink, & white or blue & white, Consecutively numbered	per 5000	\$ 460.00	\$ 425.00	\$ 468.00	\$ 465.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 465.00	\$ 470.00
<u>Accessory Apartment, Planning Board, Zoning Board of Appeals and Town Board Signs</u>								
4x. 27" x 38" sign printed on p/s 4 mil white vinyl. Accessory Apt. blue letters, Planning Board green letters, Zoning Board of appeals red letters, Town Board black letters, peel and stick adhesive on back with slit paper liner	per 100	no bid	\$ 1,765.00	\$ 825.00	\$ 1,850.00	\$ 865.00	\$ 925.00	\$ 960.00