



BID #10G39 - PAPER TOWELS AND OTHER PAPER PRODUCTS

United Supply Systems	Essential Maint Products of LI	Cleaning Systems	Amity Vacuum Inc	Central Poly Corp	WB Mason	J & F Supply Inc.	Emerald Island Supply
--------------------------	-----------------------------------	---------------------	---------------------	----------------------	-------------	----------------------	--------------------------

1 - TISSUE

1a. Tissue, Kleenex #21410, 100 per box, 36 boxes/case

Brand/Order	Kleenex 21400	Morcon*	Kimberly 21410	Kleenex 21410	Atlas #030	Marcal 293030	Handi Klonz	as spec
Boxes/Case	36/100	30/100	36	36	30/100	30	30/100	36
Price/Case	\$56.25	17.89	\$41.60	\$46.50	\$18.90	\$16.95	\$17.60	\$44.09
Brand/Order	EMR 3100-B Bagasse	* 8.25" X 6.50	High Value					
Boxes/Case	30/100	2 ply	30/2 ply					
Price/Case	\$25.50		\$19.00					

2 - PAPER TOWELS

2a. C-fold paper towels, Baywest #495 or equal 10.25" X 13" 16 bundles/case, 150 towels/bundle, 2400 towels/case

Brand/Order	Emerald EMR5900	Morcon C-122	Baywest #495	Baywest 495	Putney P100	Tork/SCACB520	Handi Klonz	P-100
Towels/Case	16/150	2400	2400	2400	2400	2400	2400	2400
Price/Case	20.35*recyc	\$21.10	\$21.50	\$18.95	\$15.30	\$19.58	\$17.00	\$18.77
				Advantage 102400				
				2400				
				\$14.75				

2b. White Roll Paper Towels, Baywest #BW465 or Equal 8" x 425' 12 Rolls/case

Brand/Order	no bid	Morcon W12350	Baywest #465	Baywest 465	Putney/P70413	no bid	Bay West	Morcon
Rolls/Case		12/350 bleached	12	12	12		12	6/800' *
Price/Case		\$24.50	\$30.25	\$21.50	\$19.30		\$43.61	\$27.55

* will fit reg disp



BID #10G39 - PAPER TOWELS AND OTHER PAPER PRODUCTS

**2c. Brown Roll Paper Towels,
Baywest #BW460 or Equal
8" x 425' 12 Rolls/case**

Brand/Order	no bid	Morcon R12350	Baywest #462*	Baywest 460	Putney/P724N	no bid	BayWest	Morcon
Rolls/Case		12/350 brown	12	12	12		12	6/800' *
Price/Case		\$23.70	\$18.99	\$19.50	\$17.99		\$36.98	\$27.55
								* will fit reg disp
	United Supply Systems	Essential Maint Products of LI	Cleaning Systems	Amity Vacuum Inc	Central Poly Corp	WB Mason	J & F Supply Inc.	Emerald Island Supply

**2d. Towels, Enmotion
model #89460 or equal**

Brand/Order	Enmotion 89460	no bid	Enmotion 89460	Georgia Pacific 89460	Enmotion 89460	Enmotion 89460	Burke	NitNY
Rolls/Case	6		6	6	6	6		6
Price/Case	\$59.75		\$53.50	\$45.90	\$56.99	\$98.70		\$45.92

3 - CUPS

**3a. Hot Cups, Styrofoam,
6 oz., Dart or Equal
1000 cups/case, 25 packages/case**

Brand/Order	6J6	no bid	Dart 6J6	Dart - 6J6	no bid	Dart 2025883	Dart	as spec
#/Case	1000		1000	1000		1000	1000	1000
Price/Case	\$14.35		\$14.35	\$12.75		\$13.71	\$15.00	\$14.94

**3b. Hot Cups, Poly Lined Paper,
8 oz., Sherri or Equal, 1000 cups/case**

Brand/Order	Emerald/EMRS6853	no bid	Solo #378	Sherri	no bid	Dixie 2338 Sage	City Line	Prime Source
#/Case	1000		1000	1000		1000	1000	1000
Price/Case	\$39.65		\$34.90	\$26.90		\$47.47	\$36.88	\$44.09



BID #10G39 - PAPER TOWELS AND OTHER PAPER PRODUCTS

3c. Paper Cups, 3 oz., Sweetheart RD3 or Equal, 100 cups/case, 50 cups per package

Brand/Order	RD3L	no bid	Solo R3	Sweetheart RD3	no bid	Solo RD35	no bid	as spec
#/Case	2400		2400	2400		5000		5000
Price/Case	\$64.00		\$54.60	\$47.50		\$128.78		\$127.15

3d. Paper Cups, 5 oz., Sweetheart R53 or Equal, 100 cups/case, 30 cups per package

Brand/Order	R53-J8000	no bid	Solo R5	Dixie 58 Sage	no bid	Solo SLOR535	Solo/SW001	as spec
#/Case	3000		3000	2400		3000	3000	3000
Price/Case	\$90.10		\$82.65	\$59.90		\$82.24	\$83.44	\$84.77

3e. Lids for Hot Cups, Dart or Equal 1000/case

Brand/Order	6JL	no bid	Solo L378FB	Dart - 6J6L	no bid	Dart/SLD2025729	Dart	as spec
#/Case	1000		1000	1000		1000	1000	1000
Price/Case	\$9.80		\$17.15	\$9.85		\$9.85	\$10.75	\$10.79

United Supply Systems	Essential Maint Products of LI	Cleaning Systems	Amity Vacuum Inc	Central Poly Corp	WB Mason	J & F Supply Inc.	Emerald Island Supply
-----------------------	--------------------------------	------------------	------------------	-------------------	----------	-------------------	-----------------------

4 - TOILET PAPER

4a. Toilet Paper, Professional Choice PC1003 9" 2-ply, JRT, 2 1/4" core, or equal - 12 rolls to a case

Brand/Order	no bid	Morcon M-29	Apatjrt800	Professional Choice	no bid	Boardwalk/BWK6100	Handi Klonz	n/a
Size		9"	9"	9" x 2' 1/4"		3.58 X 1000' *3.3 core	9"	
#/Case		12	12	12		12	12	
Price/Case		\$32.00	\$19.90	\$18.40		\$23.59	\$19.10	



BID #10G39 - PAPER TOWELS AND OTHER PAPER PRODUCTS

**4b. Toilet Paper, Compact 2-ply
White Coreless Bath Tissue or Equal
3.85" X 4.05" 1000 sheets per roll,
36 rolls/case**

Brand/Order	no bid	no bid	Compact	Baywest 616	no bid	Compact/SLD2161289	no bid	n/a
Size			3.85" X 4.05"	3.85 X 4.05		3.85 X 4.05 1000 sheets		
#/Case			36	48		36		
Price/Case			\$62.00	\$48.10		\$59.26		

**4c. Toilet Paper, 2-ply , 500 count,
B277 or equal, 96 rolls/case**

Brand/Order	EMR5701	Morcon	Atlas 210	Advantage B277	Atias/A250	pring Grove/SLD400210	Groen House	Marcon
Size		500/2ply	500/2ply	500/B277	4.5 X 3.75	500 / 4.5 X 3.0	500/2ply	500
#/Case	96	96	96	96	96	96	96	96
Price/Case	\$43.70	\$40.40	\$36.85	\$30.20	\$33.50	\$31.40	\$33.13	\$35.89

4d. Toilet Paper, 3 inch core, 3855

Brand/Order	no bid	no bid	Atlas 064	Advantage #062	no bid	no bid	Handi Klonz	Marcon
Size			12" roll	3.85 X 3855'			9"	850
#/Case			6	12			12	12
Price/Case			\$21.75	\$20.90			\$19.10	\$24.44

**NOTE: 2 bids were rejected: Ocean Janitorial Supply Inc's (did not use the bid price page)
Borax Paper Produts (quoted a minimum)**